A= PURCHASE ORDER ORIGINAI

o MEMDET
EMDET ENGINEERS PRIVATE LIMITED Order Date 08-MAY-2021 Order No. SE/21-22/2
30-1/A, HSHDC INDUSTRIAL AREA,, DHARUHERA, REWARI, HARY Rjj#e Service PO
DHARUHERA - 123106 Terms of Purchase F.O.R DESTINATION
HARYANA, INDIA Insurance INCLUSIVE
Phone : +91-1274-242039, Terms Of Payment 30 D AFT DLRY
Email : office.gurgaon@aiemdet.com
SIN No. PAN No. AABCE3453F
3STN No. 06AABCE3453F120
Please supply the following material as per the terms and conditions:-
3l From Serviced From
SMART INNOVATION INSTRUMENTS SMART INNOVATION INSTRUMENTS
D-47, 3RD FLOOR,, D-47, 3RD FLOOR,
GALI NUMBER 4, KRISHNA PARK,, GALI NUMBER 4, KRISHNA PARK,
NEW DELHI, NEW DELHI
NEW DELHI- 110018 NEW DELHI- 110018
NEW DELHI, INDIA NEW DELHI, INDIA
3STN No 67COSPK7873P1Z Type Regular GSTN No 67COSPK7873P1Z Type Regular
SNO. SERVICE NAME SAC Delivery QTY RATE DISC.% AMOUNT TAX TOTAI
1 BIS FEE OF SYSKA PROJECT 998346 15-05-2021 1.00Nos  53,000.00 0.00 53,000.00 9,5640.00 62,540.0
Total 1.00 53,000.00 9,540.00 62,5400
E&OE Total Amount ? 62,540.0
Total Taxable Amount - 53,000.00 ( RUPEES FIFTY THREE THOUSAND ONLY )
IGST:18.00% 3 9,540.00 ( RUPEES NINE THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED FORTY ONLY )
Total Invoice value 62,540.00 ( RUPEES SIXTY TWO THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED FORTY ONLY )
3 NO HSN CODE Taxable Value CGST. % AMOUNT SGST. % AMOUNT IGST % AMOUNT TOTAL
1 998346 53,000.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 18.00 9,540.00 9,540,00

‘erms & Conditions : P.T.O.
BIS&nbsp;registration fee for syska miterr pvt fiff from smart innovation instruments

=,

Checked By Approved By

09062021102717
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Narinder
== == ————— =

From: SMART INNOVATION INSTRUMENTS <smartinnovationinstruments@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, May 7, 2021 6:19 PM

To: production7@aiemdet.com

Subject: Re: BEE for AIMDET

Dear sir.

As per discuss please see the below bulb details
1: 25W 65no0s. Price for each INR 230
2:22W 20nos. Price for each INR 230

On Thu, 6 May 2021, 12:22 SMART INNOVATION INSTRUMENTS,
<smartinnovationinstruments@gmail.com> wrote:
PFA

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: SMART INNOVATION INSTRUMENTS <gsmartinnovationinstruments@gmail.com>

Date: Mon, 22 Mar 2021, 22:49

Subject: Re: BEE for AIMDET

To: Vinay Bhardwaj <vinay.bhardwaj@syskamiterr.com>, <kapil kumar(@syskamiterr.com>

Cc: Lalit Kumar <production.led@aiemdet.com>, PARITOSH BHARDWAIJ <ceo@syskamiterr.com>,

<em(@syskamiterr.com>

Dear Sir,

Please find attached here Final Invoice for your reference, kindly process the balance payment asap.
As per discussion with Mr. Vinay Sir. please proceed the following PO & payment

1. BIS fee of Syska project INR: 53000+ GST
2. Laboratory instruments installation and training: INR 40,000+GST
3. Bulb Payment (85 nos. Bulbs) : INR 19550 +GST

Regards,
smart innovation

Regards,
smart Innovation

On Thu, Mar 18, 2021 at 12:25 PM SMART INNOVATION INSTRUMENTS
<smartinnovationinstruments(@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear sir/Madam,

As discuss, we have not yet received following PO

1. BIS fee of Syska project INR: 53000+ GST
2. Laboratory instruments and training PO will be pending from EMED side: INR 40,000+GST



Greetings of the day..!

If you need any further information / clarification, please feel free to contact us. Thanking you and assuring you of our Best attention
and prompt services at all times.

Thanks & best regards,

Surjeet Prakash Verma,

Smart Innovation Instruments

D-47, 3rd floor, Gali no.4,

krishna park,New Delhi-110018

India

contact: +918470010066

Email : smartinnovationinstruments@gmail.com
Website: smartinnovationinstruments.com

Greetings of the day..!

If you need any further information / clarification, please feel free to contact us. Thanking you and assuring you of our Best attention
and prompt services at all times.

Thanks & best regards,

Surjeet Prakash Verma,

Smart Innovation Instruments

D-47, 3rd floor, Gali no.4,

krishna park,New Delhi-110018

India

contact: +918470010066

Email : smartinnovationinstruments@gmail.com
Website: smartinnovationinstruments.com
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PURCHASE ORDER

ORIGINAI

# EMDET ENGINEERS PRIVATE LIMITED Order Date 08-MAY-2021 Order No. CW/21-22/77
30-1/A, HSIIDC INDUSTRIAL AREA,, DHARUHERA, Type Consumables
REWARI, HARYANA DHARUHERA - 123106 Terms of Purchase F.O.R DESTINATION
HARYANA, INDIA Insurance INCLUSIVE
Phone : +91-1274-242039, Terms Of Payment 30 D AFT DLRY
Email : office.gurgaon@aiemdet.com Modify Date
>IN No. PAN No. AABCE3453F
3STN No. 06AABCE3453F120
Please supply the following material as per the terms and conditions:-
3ill To Ship To
EMDET ENGINEERS PRIVATE LIMITED EMDET ENGINEERS PRIVATE LIMITED
30-1/A, HSIIDC INDUSTRIAL AREA,, 30-1/A, HSIIDC INDUSTRIAL AREA,,
DHARUHERA, DHARUHERA,
REWARI, HARYANA, REWARI, HARYANA,
DHARUHERA- 123106 DHARUHERA- 123106
HARYANA, INDIA HARYANA, INDIA
Phone : +91-1274-242039, Phone : +91-1274-242038,
iSTN No 06AABCE3453F120 GSTN No 06AABCE3453F120
3l From Shipped From
SMART INNOVATION INSTRUMENTS SMART INNOVATION INSTRUMENTS
D-47, 3RD FLOOR,, D-47, 3RD FLOOR,
GALI NUMBER 4, KRISHNA PARK,, GALI NUMBER 4, KRISHNA PARK,
NEW DELHI, NEW DELHI
NEW DELHI- 110018 NEW DELHI- 110018
NEW DELHI, INDIA NEW DELHI, INDIA
3STN No (57COSPK7873P1Z Type Regular GSTN No 07COSPK7873P1Z Type Regular
SNO. CONSUMABLES NAME HSN Delivery Date QTY RATE DISC.% AMOUNT TAX TOTAI
1 Bulbs Samples (BIS testing Smart 9405 08-05-2021 85.00Nos 230.00 0.00 19,550.00 2,346.00 21,896.0
innovation) Total 19,550.00  2,346.00 21,896.0
Total Amount # 21,886.0

E&OE
Total Taxable Amount
IGST:12.00%

Total Invoice value

19,550.00 ( RUPEES NINETEEN THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED FIFTY ONLY )
2,346.00 ( RUPEES TWO THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED FORTY SIX ONLY )
21,896.00 ( RUPEES TWENTY ONE THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED NINTY SIX ONLY )

3NO HSN CODE Taxable Value CGST. % AMOUNT SGST. %

AMOUNT

IGST. % AMOUNT

TOTAL

1 9405 19,550.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

‘erms & Conditions : P.T.O.

12.00 2,346.00 2,346

0.00

These Bulbs Samples 85 nos (22W-20 nos and 25w-65 nos) Purchased by BIS registration agency (Smart Innovation Instruments) for BIS testing
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Narinder

= =i
From: SMART INNOVATION INSTRUMENTS <smartinnovationinstruments@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, May 7, 2021 6:19 PM
To: production7@aiemdet.com
Subject: Re: BEE for AIMDET

Dear sir.

As per discuss please see the below bulb details
1: 25W 65nos. Price for each INR 230

2: 22W 20nos. Price for each INR 230

On Thu, 6 May 2021, 12:22 SMART INNOVATION INSTRUMENTS,

<smartinnovationinstruments@gmail.com> wrote:

PFA

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: SMART INNOVATION INSTRUMENTS <smartinnovationinstruments@gmail.com>

Date: Mon, 22 Mar 2021, 22:49

Subject: Re: BEE for AIMDET

To: Vinay Bhardwaj <vinay.bhardwaj@syskamiterr.com>, <kapil. kumar(@syskamiterr.com>

Cc: Lalit Kumar <production.led@aiemdet.com>, PARITOSH BHARDWAJ <ceo@syskamiterr.com>,

<em(@syskamiterr.com>

Dear Sir,

Please find attached here Final Invoice for your reference, kindly process the balance payment asap.
As per discussion with Mr. Vinay Sir. please proceed the following PO & payment

1. BIS fee of Syska project INR: 53000+ GST
2. Laboratory instruments installation and training: INR 40,000+GST
3. Bulb Payment (85 nos. Bulbs) : INR 19550 +GST

Regards,
smart innovation

Regards,
smart Innovation

On Thu, Mar 18, 2021 at 12:25 PM SMART INNOVATION INSTRUMENTS
<smartinnovationinstruments@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear sir/Madam,

As discuss, we have not yet received following PO

1. BIS fee of Syska project INR: 53000+ GST
2. Laboratory instruments and training PO will be pending from EMED side: INR 40,000+GST



Greetings of the day..!

If you need any further information / clarification, please feel free to contact us. Thanking you and assuring you of our Best attention
and prompt services at all times.

Thanks & best regards,

Surjeet Prakash Verma,

Smart Innovation Instruments

D-47, 3rd floor, Gali no.4,

krishna park,New Delhi-110018

India

contact: +918470010066

Email : smartinnovationinstruments@gmail.com
Website: smartinnovationinstruments.com -

= -

Greetings of the day..!

If you need any further information / clarification, please feel free to contact us. Thanking you and assuring you of our Best attention
and prompt services at all times.

Thanks & best regards,

Surjeet Prakash Verma,

Smart Innovation Instruments

D-47, 3rd floor, Gali no.4,

krishna park,New Delhi-110018

India

contact: +918470010066

Email : smartinnovationinstruments@gmail.com
Website: smartinnovationinstruments.com
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